
$479,900 - 35 Queen St, Hornepayne
MLS® #SM242311 

$479,900
4 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 2,210 sqft
Single Family on 0 Acres

Hornepayne, Hornepayne, Ontario

Truly, a one of a kind 4 parcel property Found
in Hornepayne Ontario. This 2200 sqft. 4
bedroom two bath Bungalow shows pride of
ownership throughout. Open Concept kitchen,
dining living room And grand foyer hosts
ample Space for Entertaining. Into the full
basement for The second living room with bar
second bathroom and fourth bedroom.
Backyard access from the home. There is
room to enjoy your own space within the four
parcels of land. Or escape to the man cave,
Where inside youâ€™ll  find the two bay Shop
with Ample storage, a Full bathroom, Office
space, Murphy bed, and fridge. This 48 x 46
garage has two sources, Hydro, and is well
insulated. With a steel roof on the house and
the garage and all of the upgrades done to this
turnkey, immaculate home, it checks all the
boxes. And is a must see! (id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # SM242311

Price $479,900

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.00

Square Footage 2,210

Acres 0.00

Type Single Family

Style Bungalow

Community Information



Address 35 Queen St

Subdivision Hornepayne

City Hornepayne

Province Ontario

Postal Code P0M1Z0

Amenities

Utilities Electricity, Telephone

Features Crushed stone driveway

Parking Garage, Gravel

# of Garages 1

Interior

Appliances Dishwasher, Water softener, Stove, Dryer, Blinds, Refrigerator, Washer

Heating Oil Boiler

Has Basement Yes

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Vinyl

Lot Description 66x150|under 1/2 acre

Foundation Poured Concrete

Listing Details

Listing Office Exit Realty True North
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