
$257,500 - 1250 Hillside Avenue Unit# 4, Chase
MLS® #177028 

$257,500
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,214 sqft
Single Family on 0 Acres

Chase, Chase, British Columbia

This immaculate two-bedroom, two-bathroom
manufactured home was build in 2006 and is
move in ready. With a spacious 10x29
addition, this home is in perfect move-in
condition. The open floor plan was freshly
painted throughout, including the porch, shop,
and deck. New plank flooring and skylights
add to the bright and airy feel of the home.
The kitchen is a standout feature, with ample
cupboard space and plenty of room for
storage. Outside, you'll find a pergola and
many other upgrades that enhance the overall
appeal of the property. The master bedroom
boasts a walk-in closet and a four-piece
ensuite, while the large second bedroom
features a built-in Murphy bed. The workshop
is equipped with custom-built shelves, perfect
for any handyman or DIY enthusiast. The
home also comes with newer appliances, a
metal roof, and everything is easy to maintain.
A garden shed with a new workbench is
included, along with a fully landscaped yard.
Plus, enjoy a short walk to the lake! (id:6289)

Built in 2006

Essential Information

Listing # 177028

Price $257,500

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 2.00

Square Footage 1,214



Acres 0.00

Year Built 2006

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Manufactured Home

Style Ranch

Community Information

Address 1250 Hillside Avenue Unit# 4

Subdivision Chase

City Chase

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V0E1M0

Amenities

Amenities Park, Recreation

Interior

Appliances Range, Refrigerator, Dishwasher, Washer & Dryer

Heating Forced air

Cooling Window air conditioner

Exterior

Exterior Vinyl siding

Roof Metal

Foundation Stone

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office eXp Realty (Kamloops)
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