
$464,900 - 399 Murray Drive, Warfield
MLS® #10333202 

$464,900
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,800 sqft
Single Family on 0 Acres

Village of Warfield, Warfield, British Columbia

Nestled in the charming community of
Warfield, this beautiful character home offers a
perfect blend of timeless charm and modern
comfort. Located just across the street from
Webster Elementary School and steps away
from the Warfield pool, this property is ideal for
families and those who enjoy a close-knit
neighborhood. The home sits on a fully fenced
and landscaped lot, complete with a storage
shed, lilac bushes, and a variety of perennials
that add vibrant color throughout the seasons.
The spacious deck is perfect for entertaining,
hosting family barbecues, or simply relaxing in
your private outdoor oasis. Inside, the main
floor features a cozy living room with a natural
gas fireplace, a large formal dining room with
custom built-ins, and a galley-style kitchen with
beautiful cabinetry. Original hardwood floors
add warmth and character, while a convenient
powder room completes this level. Upstairs,
youâ€™ll find two generous bedrooms and a
full bathroom, offering plenty of space for
relaxation. The lower level provides additional
versatility with a large bedroom that could
easily function as a rec room, along with a
utility/laundry room and a storage room. An
oversized detached single garage adds
convenience, providing ample space for
parking and storage. With its prime location
and thoughtful features, this home is a rare
find in the heart of Warfield. (id:6289)

Built in 1935



Essential Information

Listing # 10333202

Price $464,900

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 1,800

Acres 0.13

Year Built 1935

Type Single Family

Sub-Type House

Community Information

Address 399 Murray Drive

Subdivision Village of Warfield

City Warfield

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V1R2J5

Amenities

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Detached Garage

# of Garages 1

Interior

Heating In Floor Heating

# of Stories 3

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX All Pro Realty
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